

CEDAR FALLS COMMUNITY SCHOOLS  
1002 West First Street  
Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613

DATE: June 12, 2017

SUBJECT: Bread Products Bid

FROM: Doug Nefzger, Director of Business Affairs

BIDDER'S LIST

	Bimbo Bakeries USA	Pan-O-Gold
Bread, whole grain	\$1.30 20 slices 0.065	No Bid
Bread, white	\$1.29 24 slices .05375/slice	No Bid
Hamburger Buns, whole grain	\$1.20 26 oz. 0.0461	No Bid
Blunt Coney Bun, whole grain	\$1.60 34.4 oz. 0.0465	No Bid
Steak Roll, whole grain	\$3.40 72 oz 0.0472	No Bid
Dinner Rolls, whole wheat	\$1.20 17 oz. 0.0705	No Bid
Hoagie Bun	\$3.40 72 oz. 0.0472	No Bid

Recommend acceptance of bid by Bimbo Bakeries.

CEDAR FALLS COMMUNITY SCHOOLS  
1002 West First Street  
Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613

SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET FOR  
BREAD PRODUCTS

April 24, 2017

Bids will be received until 1:00 p.m., May 12, 2017, at the Business Office of the Board of Education, 1002 West First Street, Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613. Submit one copy in an envelope marked "BREAD PRODUCTS."

The award of contract may be made by the Board of Directors of the Cedar Falls Community School District to any responsible bidder or bidders offering suitable supplies, equipment and/or service at the lowest price, taking into consideration the quality of materials and/or service in the best interests of the School District. The right is reserved to reject any and all bids, or any part thereof, and to waive informalities, irregularities, or technicalities in any bid and to enter into such contract or contracts as shall be deemed in the best interest of the Cedar Falls Community School District.

All bids must be made upon the forms supplied by the School District. Return completed copy to the purchaser. A copy should be retained by the bidder. Successful bidders will be asked to complete a nutrient analysis report at time of bid award for each item vendor will be supplying.

Bread products must meet Federal, State of Iowa, Department of Public Instruction, and local regulations. Products failing to meet specifications will be returned at vendor expense.

ADDITIONAL SPECIFICATIONS:

1. Bidder agrees to furnish bread products during the 2017 - 2018 school year.
2. Deliveries are to be made to Peet Junior High and Cedar Falls Senior High School by 7:30 a.m. on a four day a week basis, Monday through Friday. Items will be ordered as needed by the Food Service Department. Estimated amounts are indicated for each item. Company must furnish a customer service person and phone number for early morning problems (6:30 a.m.)
3. All items will be awarded to one vendor.
4. Items will be awarded at low bid for cost per ounce, slice and/or bun.
5. The package of items 3, 4 and 5 should fit a box measuring 23 5/8" x 19 1/4" x 4 1/8".
6. Company must furnish proof of actual bun size.
7. Company must provide nutritional information for each product.
8. Must not contain peanuts, nuts or nut products
9. Company must provide a copy of their latest health inspection report or provide a letter indicating evidence of their participation in a food safety program or HACCP Plan.
10. Company must provide clean racks and trays for the bread products.
11. No bids will be accepted by fax machine.
12. Please include pricing for any additional and available products that contain whole grain or contain the FDA required label "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."

BREAD PRODUCTS  
2017-2018

- Item #1 Bread 1-1/2 pound loaf, 51 % whole grain product (Estimate 2,000 loaves)  
Ingredient label must list first ingredient as a whole grain or documentation from the manufacturer must indicate the ingredient is a whole grain or that other whole grains, when added together, are by weight 51% of the total grain used in the product. No documentation is needed if the product contains the Food & Drug Administration required label: "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."  
Slice must be 28.35 grams or 1 oz.  
State number of slices per loaf EXCLUDING end slices \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid Price \_\_\_\_\_ per loaf F.O.B. School
- Item #2 White Bread 1-1/2 pound loaf (Estimate 1,700 loaves)  
Slice must be 28.35 grams or 1 oz.  
State number of slices per loaf EXCLUDING end slices \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid Price \_\_\_\_\_ per loaf F.O.B. School
- Item #3 Hamburger Buns, whole grain product (Estimate 10,000 dozen)  
Ingredient label must list first ingredient as a whole grain or documentation from the manufacturer must indicate the ingredient is a whole grain or that other whole grains, when added together, are by weight 51% of the total grain used in the product. No documentation is needed if the product contains the Food & Drug Administration required label: "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."  
Bun must be no less than 50 grams = 1.80 oz.  
State number of buns per package \_\_\_\_\_  
State minimum package weight \_\_\_\_\_  
Package measurements \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid Price \_\_\_\_\_ per package F.O.B. School
- Item #4 Blunt Coney Bun, whole grain product (Estimate 3,000 dozen)  
Ingredient label must list first ingredient as a whole grain or documentation from the manufacturer must indicate the ingredient is a whole grain or that other whole grains, when added together, are by weight 51% of the total grain used in the product. No documentation is needed if the product contains the Food & Drug Administration required label: "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."  
Bun must be no less than 50 grams = 1.80 oz.  
State number of buns per package \_\_\_\_\_  
State minimum package weight \_\_\_\_\_  
Package measurements \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid Price \_\_\_\_\_ per package F.O.B. School

Item #5

Steak Roll, whole grain product (Estimate 300 dozen)  
Ingredient label must list first ingredient as a whole grain or documentation from the manufacturer must indicate the ingredient is a whole grain or that other whole grains, when added together, are by weight 51% of the total grain used in the product. No documentation is needed if the product contains the Food & Drug Administration required label: "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."  
Bun must be no less than 50 grams = 1.80 oz.  
State number of buns per package \_\_\_\_\_  
State minimum package weight \_\_\_\_\_  
Package measurements \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid Price \_\_\_\_\_ per package F.O.B. School

Item #6

Dinner Rolls, Whole Wheat (Estimate 8,000 dozen)  
Roll size must be no less than 25 grams = 1 oz.  
Ingredient label must list first ingredient as a whole grain or documentation from the manufacturer must indicate the ingredient is a whole grain or that other whole grains, when added together, are by weight 51% of the total grain used in the product. No documentation is needed if the product contains the Food & Drug Administration required label: "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."  
State number of rolls per package \_\_\_\_\_  
State minimum package weight \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid Price \_\_\_\_\_ per package F.O.B. School

Item #7

Hoagie Bun (Estimated 600 dozen)  
Ingredient label must list first ingredient as a whole grain or documentation from the manufacturer must indicate the ingredient is a whole grain or that other whole grains, when added together, are by weight 51% of the total grain used in the product. No documentation is needed if the product contains the Food & Drug Administration required label: "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."  
Bun must be no less than 2.74 oz  
State number of uns per package \_\_\_\_\_  
State minimum package weight \_\_\_\_\_  
Package measurements \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid price \_\_\_\_\_ per package F.O.B. School

---

Authorized Signature

---

Name of Firm

---

Street Address

---

City State Zip

---

Telephone Number

---

Date

---

Email