

CEDAR FALLS COMMUNITY SCHOOLS  
 1002 West First Street  
 Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613

DATE: June 11, 2018

SUBJECT: Bread Products Bid

FROM: Doug Nefzger, Director of Business Affairs

BIDDER'S LIST

	Bimbo Bakeries USA	Pan-O-Gold	Martin Brothers
Bread, whole grain	\$1.40 20 slices .07/slice	\$1.60 25 slices .064/slice	No Bid
Bread, white	\$1.39 24 slices .0579/slice	\$1.15 25 slices .046/slice	No Bid
Hamburger Buns, whole grain	\$1.32 26 oz. 0.0507	\$7.00 7.56 lb. 0.0578	No Bid
Blunt Coney Bun, whole grain	\$1.76 34.4 oz. 0.0511	\$3.35 2.77 lb. 0.0755	No Bid
Steak Roll, whole grain	\$3.64 72 oz. 0.0505	\$3.50 3.76 lb. 0.0581	No Bid
Dinner Rolls, whole wheat	\$1.26 17 oz. 0.0741	\$1.10 11.85 oz. 0.0928	No Bid
Hoagie Bun	\$3.64 72 oz. 0.0505	\$3.50 3.01 lb. 0.0726	No Bid

Recommend acceptance of bid by Bimbo Bakeries.

CEDAR FALLS COMMUNITY SCHOOLS  
1002 West First Street  
Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613

SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET FOR  
BREAD PRODUCTS

April 23, 2018

Bids will be received until 1:00 p.m., May 11, 2018, at the Business Office of the Board of Education, 1002 West First Street, Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613. Submit one copy in an envelope marked "BREAD PRODUCTS."

The award of contract may be made by the Board of Directors of the Cedar Falls Community School District to any responsible bidder or bidders offering suitable supplies, equipment and/or service at the lowest price, taking into consideration the quality of materials and/or service in the best interests of the School District. The right is reserved to reject any and all bids, or any part thereof, and to waive informalities, irregularities, or technicalities in any bid and to enter into such contract or contracts as shall be deemed in the best interest of the Cedar Falls Community School District.

All bids must be made upon the forms supplied by the School District. Return completed copy to the purchaser. A copy should be retained by the bidder. Successful bidders will be asked to complete a nutrient analysis report at time of bid award for each item vendor will be supplying.

Bread products must meet Federal, State of Iowa, Department of Public Instruction, and local regulations. Products failing to meet specifications will be returned at vendor expense.

ADDITIONAL SPECIFICATIONS:

1. Bidder agrees to furnish bread products during the 2018 - 2019 school year.
2. Deliveries are to be made to Peet Junior High, 525 E. Seerley Blvd., Aldrich Elementary, 2516 Ashworth Dr., and Cedar Falls Senior High School, 1015 Division St. by 7:30 a.m. on a **four day a week basis**, Monday through Friday. Items will be ordered as needed by the Food Service Department. Estimated amounts are indicated for each item. Company must furnish a customer service person and phone number for early morning problems (6:30 a.m.)
3. All items will be awarded to one vendor.
4. Items will be awarded at low bid for cost per ounce, slice and/or bun.
5. The package of items 3, 4 and 5 should fit a box measuring 23 5/8" x 19 1/4" x 4 1/8".
6. Company must furnish proof of actual bun size.
7. Company must provide nutritional information for each product.
8. Must not contain peanuts, nuts or nut products
9. Company must provide a copy of their latest health inspection report or provide a letter indicating evidence of their participation in a food safety program or HACCP Plan.
10. Company must provide clean racks and trays for the bread products.
11. No bids will be accepted by fax machine.
12. Please include pricing for any additional and available products that contain whole grain or contain the FDA required label "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."

BREAD PRODUCTS  
2018-2019

- Item #1 Bread 1-1/2 pound loaf, 51 % whole grain product (Estimate 2,000 loaves)  
Ingredient label must list first ingredient as a whole grain or documentation from the manufacturer must indicate the ingredient is a whole grain or that other whole grains, when added together, are by weight 51% of the total grain used in the product. No documentation is needed if the product contains the Food & Drug Administration required label: "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."  
Slice must be 28.35 grams or 1 oz.  
State number of slices per loaf EXCLUDING end slices \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid Price \_\_\_\_\_ per loaf F.O.B. School
- Item #2 White Bread 1-1/2 pound loaf (Estimate 1,700 loaves)  
Slice must be 28.35 grams or 1 oz.  
State number of slices per loaf EXCLUDING end slices \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid Price \_\_\_\_\_ per loaf F.O.B. School
- Item #3 Hamburger Buns, whole grain product (Estimate 10,000 dozen)  
Ingredient label must list first ingredient as a whole grain or documentation from the manufacturer must indicate the ingredient is a whole grain or that other whole grains, when added together, are by weight 51% of the total grain used in the product. No documentation is needed if the product contains the Food & Drug Administration required label: "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."  
Bun must be no less than 50 grams = 1.80 oz.  
State number of buns per package \_\_\_\_\_  
State minimum package weight \_\_\_\_\_  
Package measurements \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid Price \_\_\_\_\_ per package F.O.B. School
- Item #4 Blunt Coney Bun, whole grain product (Estimate 3,000 dozen)  
Ingredient label must list first ingredient as a whole grain or documentation from the manufacturer must indicate the ingredient is a whole grain or that other whole grains, when added together, are by weight 51% of the total grain used in the product. No documentation is needed if the product contains the Food & Drug Administration required label: "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."  
Bun must be no less than 50 grams = 1.80 oz.  
State number of buns per package \_\_\_\_\_  
State minimum package weight \_\_\_\_\_  
Package measurements \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid Price \_\_\_\_\_ per package F.O.B. School

Item #5      Steak Roll, whole grain product (Estimate 300 dozen)  
Ingredient label must list first ingredient as a whole grain or documentation from the manufacturer must indicate the ingredient is a whole grain or that other whole grains, when added together, are by weight 51% of the total grain used in the product. No documentation is needed if the product contains the Food & Drug Administration required label: "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."  
Bun must be no less than 50 grams = 1.80 oz.  
State number of buns per package \_\_\_\_\_  
State minimum package weight \_\_\_\_\_  
Package measurements \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid Price \_\_\_\_\_ per package F.O.B. School

Item #6      Dinner Rolls, Whole Wheat (Estimate 8,000 dozen)  
Roll size must be no less than 25 grams = 1 oz.  
Ingredient label must list first ingredient as a whole grain or documentation from the manufacturer must indicate the ingredient is a whole grain or that other whole grains, when added together, are by weight 51% of the total grain used in the product. No documentation is needed if the product contains the Food & Drug Administration required label: "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."  
State number of rolls per package \_\_\_\_\_  
State minimum package weight \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid Price \_\_\_\_\_ per package F.O.B. School

Item #7      Hoagie Bun (Estimated 600 dozen)  
Ingredient label must list first ingredient as a whole grain or documentation from the manufacturer must indicate the ingredient is a whole grain or that other whole grains, when added together, are by weight 51% of the total grain used in the product. No documentation is needed if the product contains the Food & Drug Administration required label: "Diets rich in whole grain foods and other plant foods and low in total fat, saturated fat and cholesterol, may help reduce the risk of heart disease and certain cancers."  
Bun must be no less than 2.74 oz  
State number of uns per package \_\_\_\_\_  
State minimum package weight \_\_\_\_\_  
Package measurements \_\_\_\_\_  
Bid price \_\_\_\_\_ per package F.O.B. School

---

Authorized Signature

---

Name of Firm

---

Street Address

---

City State Zip

---

Telephone Number

---

Date

---

Email

CEDAR FALLS COMMUNITY SCHOOLS  
 1002 West First Street  
 Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613

DATE: June 11, 2018

SUBJECT: Milk Bid

FROM: Doug Nefzger, Director of Business Affairs

**BIDDER'S LIST**

**FIRM PRICES**

	<u>Anderson- Erickson</u>	<u>Prairie Farms</u>
White Homogenized L.F. (Skim)	0.2410	0.2728
Chocolate Homogenized L.F. (Skim)	0.2520	0.3050
Strawberry Homogenized L.F. (Skim)	0.2520	0.3143
White Homogenized 1% B.F.	0.2530	0.2890

**ESCALATOR PRICES**

	<u>Anderson- Erickson</u>		<u>Prairie Farms</u>	
		Maximum		Maximum
White Homogenized L.F. (Skim)	0.2010	-----	0.2228	-----
Chocolate Homogenized L.F. (Skim)	0.2120	-----	0.2550	-----
Strawberry Homogenized L.F. (Skim)	0.2120	-----	0.2643	-----
White Homogenized 1% B.F.	0.2130	-----	0.2390	-----

	<u>Anderson- Erickson Firm BID PRICE</u>	<u>Anderson- Erickson Escalator BID PRICE</u>	<u>Prairie Farms Escalator BID PRICE</u>
Light Sour Cream, Grade A Homogenized, 5#	\$7.30	\$7.00	\$9.65
Orange Juice - 100% juice, 4 oz. Carton	\$0.0205	\$0.2000	\$0.2200
Yogurt - low fat, Grade A, 1% milk fat. 6 oz. carton, assorted flavors	\$0.5300	\$0.5200	\$0.5500
Yogurt - low fat, Grade A, 1% milk fat. 5 # container, assorted flavors	\$5.9500	\$5.8000	\$6.7500

Anderson Erickson successful bidder. (Escalator bid)  
Anderson Erickson is successful bidder for sour cream, orange juice,  
and yogurt.



CEDAR FALLS COMMUNITY SCHOOLS  
1002 West First Street  
Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613

SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET FOR  
FURNISHING MILK

April 23, 2018

Bids will be received until 1:00 p.m., May 11, 2018, at the Business Office of the Board of Education, 1002 West First Street, Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613. Submit one copy of the bid in an envelope marked "MILK BID".

The award of contract may be made by the Board of Directors of the Cedar Falls Community School District to any responsible bidder or bidders offering suitable supplies, equipment, and/or service at the lowest price, taking into consideration the quality of materials and/or service in the best interests of the School District. The right is reserved to reject any and all bids, or any part thereof, and to waive informalities, irregularities, or technicalities in any bid and to enter into such contract or contracts as shall be deemed in the best interests of the Cedar Falls Community School District.

Milk and the milk container and cases must meet Federal, State and Iowa, Department of Public Instruction, and local regulations. Milk, milk containers and cases failing to meet specifications will be returned at vendor's expense. The successful bidder who fails to meet these specifications shall be subject to contract cancellation.

Successful bidders will be asked to complete a nutrient analysis report at time of bid award for each item vendor will be supplying.

ADDITIONAL SPECIFICATIONS:

1. Bidder agrees to furnish milk during the 2018-2019 School Year. (August, 2018 to July, 2019). Estimated 2018-2019 consumption for bid analysis is: 275,000 half pints of white, 375,000 half pints of chocolate and 100,000 half pints of strawberry. Chocolate, white and strawberry milk bids will be awarded to one vendor.
2. Bid shall be based on furnishing Grade A milk in half-pint paper carton.
3. Deliveries are to be made to all schools by 7:30 a.m. twice per week, based on schedule provided. No double deliveries except in case of emergencies and prior approval must be secured from the Supervisor of Food Services. Summer deliveries will be as arranged with the building principal. Vendor shall pick up half-pints remaining in the buildings during the various vacation times.

**Cedar Falls School District - Milk Delivery Schedule**

School	Address	Monday	Tuesday	Wednesday	Thursday	Friday
Cedar Falls High School	1015 Division St		√			√
Holmes Jr High	505 Holmes Dr		√			√
Peet Jr High	525 E Seerley Blvd	√			√	
Aldrich	2526 Ashworth Dr	√			√	
Cedar Heights	2417 Rainbow Dr	√			√	
Hansen	616 Holmes Dr		√			√
Lincoln	321 W 8th St		√			√
North Cedar	2419 Fern Ave		√			√
Orchard Hill	3909 Rownd St	√			√	
Southdale	627 Orchard Dr	√			√	
River Hills	2700 Grand Blvd	√*				

\* River Hills delivery is once per week

4. Bidders must be able to deliver extra milk upon request from the Supervisor of Food Services with one (1) or two (2) days notice. Milk ordered for Saturday, must be delivered on Friday afternoon.
5. Successful bidder must also furnish coolers, where needed, to meet the cooling requirements for daily delivery. Estimated need: 4 coolers. The coolers are to be in good repair and clean appearance. (We do not want old rusty equipment in our buildings.)
6. Milk cartons and crates must be in clean condition. Damaged or opened milk cartons must be removed or replaced. Appropriate credit must be provided on invoices. Crating should be appropriate to accommodate paper cartons.
7. Truck drivers are to rotate the inventory, so milk remaining from one day will be used first the next day.
8. To assure that fresh milk products are being served, the cartons shall bear dates at least seven (7) days in advance of the delivery date. (Example: if the delivery date is the 10th, milk marked the 17th and later would be acceptable.)
9. The truck driver will take the temperature of one carton of milk from each new delivery at each building and record that temperature and time on the districts posted chart and initial that recording.
10. Company must provide proof of having a HACCP program or similar food safety program in place.
11. All items, milk and dairy supplies, will be awarded to one vendor.
12. No bids will be accepted by fax machine.

13. Any bidder who did not sell to the school district during the 2017-2018 school year shall furnish at least two references who can vouch for bidders' quality of product and service. These references should be schools, hospitals, etc., who used the bidder's milk during the 2017-2018 school year.

1. Name \_\_\_\_\_

Address \_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_

Telephone \_\_\_\_\_

2. Name \_\_\_\_\_

Address \_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_

Telephone \_\_\_\_\_

14. The school district is seeking bids for both firm and escalator prices. At the time of bid opening, the school district will assess the bids and best available market conditions and will make the award based on what is in the best interests of the school district. Escalator prices are to be based on using June costs for raw milk.

CEDAR FALLS COMMUNITY SCHOOL  
1002 West First Street  
Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613

2018 - 2019 SCHOOL YEAR

I. Half-Pint Paper Milk Cartons

	BRAND NAME	FIRM PRICE (per carton)
White Homogenized - L.F. (Skim)	_____	_____
Chocolate Homogenized - L.F. (Skim)	_____	_____
Strawberry Homogenized - L.F. (Skim)	_____	_____
White Homogenized - 1% B.F.	_____	_____

Will vendor guarantee that the escalator price will not go over a certain maximum?

Yes

No

If yes, state maximums for each items in column provided.

	BRAND NAME	ESCALATOR PRICE (per carton)	MAXIMUM PRICE
White Homogenized - L.F. (Skim)	_____	_____	_____
Chocolate Homogenized - L.F. (Skim)	_____	_____	_____
Strawberry Homogenized - L.F. (Skim)	_____	_____	_____
White Homogenized - 1% B.F.	_____	_____	_____

BID PRICE

2. Light Sour Cream, Grade A Homogenized, 5#

\_\_\_\_\_

3. Orange Juice - 100% juice, 4 oz. carton

\_\_\_\_\_

4. Yogurt - low fat, Grade A, 1% milk fat, 6 oz. carton  
Assorted flavors as needed.

\_\_\_\_\_

5. Yogurt - low fat, Grade A, 1% milk fat, 5# container,  
Assorted flavors as needed.

\_\_\_\_\_

\_\_\_\_\_  
Authorized Signature

\_\_\_\_\_  
Name of Firm

\_\_\_\_\_  
Street Address

\_\_\_\_\_  
City

\_\_\_\_\_  
State

\_\_\_\_\_  
Zip

\_\_\_\_\_  
Telephone Number

\_\_\_\_\_  
Date

\_\_\_\_\_  
Email

CEDAR FALLS COMMUNITY SCHOOLS  
1002 West First Street  
Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613

DATE: June 11, 2018

SUBJECT: Food Service Paper Supply Bid

FROM: Doug Nefzger, Director of Business Affairs

BIDDER'S LIST

<u>Company</u>	<u>Item Number</u>	<u>Cost</u>
Interboro Packaging	1, 5, 7, 29, 30	\$2,405.44
Martin Brothers	2, 3, 4, 6, 9, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 46, 47, 48,	\$41,497.92
Unipak Coproration	-----	----
Wallace Packaging	24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 31, 32, 43, 44, 45	\$14,085.25
Tim Wittstock Company	33	\$101.00
	<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>\$58,089.61</b>

Item #8, 10, 34 - Received no bids.

Recommend acceptance of all low bids.

CEDAR FALLS COMMUNITY SCHOOLS  
1002 West First Street  
Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613

SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET FOR  
FOOD SERVICE PAPER SUPPLIES

April 23, 2018

Bids will be received until 1:00 p.m., May 10, 2018, at the Business Office of the Board of Education, 1002 West First Street, Cedar Falls, Iowa 50613. Submit one copy in an envelope marked "FOOD SERVICE PAPER SUPPLIES BID."

The award of contract may be made by the Board of Directors of the Cedar Falls Community School District to any responsible bidder or bidders offering suitable supplies, equipment and/or service at the lowest price, taking into consideration the quality of materials and/or service in the best interests of the School District. The right is reserved to reject any and all bids, or any part thereof, and to waive informalities, irregularities, or technicalities in any bid and to enter into such contract or contracts as shall be deemed in the best interests of the Cedar Falls Community School District.

All bids must be made upon the forms supplied by the School District. Return completed copy to the purchaser. A copy should be retained by the bidder.

Items other than those listed will be considered, but samples must be furnished with the bids.

ADDITIONAL SPECIFICATIONS:

1. Bids will be awarded on an item basis. It is further understood that if the total of the bid items awarded to any one bidder is less than \$50.00, the involved item(s) will be awarded to the next higher bidder. The school will begin with the bidder with the lowest awarded amount and proceed with awarding to the next higher bidder until the minimum is reached.
2. No bids will be accepted by fax machine.
3. Delivery Date: Items to be delivered no later than July 16, 2018.



Item No.	Quantity	Unit	Stock No.	Description	Trade Name & Other Information	Unit Price	Total Price
1	5	Case/500	Foodhandler 250-FH20	Aprons, white plastic, bib style, 28" X 46"	Sample required		
2	75	Bundle/500	Duro Bag Mfr# 18406	Sack, Brown Paper, 6#, 11" tall, 5.75" wide, 3.75" gusset			
3	10	Bundle/500	Duro Bag Mfr# 51002	Bags, popcorn sack, paper, white, #2			
4	10	Case/2,000	Ecoliner MHR242406C	Bags, clear garbage 7-10 gallon, 24" X 24"			
5	20	Case/2,000	Handgards 304985495	Bags, sandwich, 7"x 7"			
6	12	Case/500	Foodhandler 20-FH50	Bag, plastic, quart, 7" X 8" recloseable			
7	15	Case/200	Food Handler 22-PB27	Bags, Bun Pan, Tuffguard, 27" x 37"			
8	35	Case/~750		Bowls, plastic, small square or round, black, microwaveable, 6 oz.	Sample required will need lid, see item No. 34		
9	22	Case/500	Sabert 75112B500	Bowls, plastic, round, black, microwaveable, 12 oz.			
10	40	1 box set		Boxes, bakery bread, dimensions 25-1/2 x 17-1/2 x 4.18; Tops, 25.08 x 17.08 x 4.02 Bottoms			
11	15	Case/252	Pactiv CN8-5512	Casserole, 12 oz., black oval, ovenable, 7-7/8" x 5" x 2-3/16"	Sample required		
12	25	Case/600		Casserole, black, ovenable, 16 oz container, plastic, 1C			
13	25	Case/1,000	Solo TP10D	Cups, parfait cup, plastic, 10 oz. ultra clear			

Item No.	Quantity	Unit	Stock No.	Description	Trade Name & Other Information	Unit Price	Total Price
14	5	Case/2,500	Solo B200N	Cups, plastic portion, 2 oz., translucent plastic cup			
15	25	Case/900	Dixie 87220	Cup, plastic portion, 4 oz., square, with lid			
16	90	Case/1,000	Solo S605T-J800	Container, paper, 5 oz., Symphony			
17	15	Case/5,000	Sweetheart 550-2050	Cup, pleated paper souffle, 5.5 oz.			
18	30	Case/1,000	Wincup F4	Cup, squat, 4 oz. Wincup			
19	40	Case/1,000	Wincup F6	Cup, foam, 6 oz. squat			
20	100	Case/500	Wincup	Cup, foam, 8 oz. squat			
21	5	Case/375	Pactiv YC1811600	Container, plastic hinged, 1C 6 x 6, clear			
22	80	Case/200	Pactiv YC181120	Deli container, plastic hinged container, clear, 8"	Sample required		
23	10	Case/2,500	0101-4940204	Foil Wrap, gold, 10.5" x 13", paper lined, imprinted 13" geometric graphic			
24	180	4/250 ct.	Kant Leak SQP8707	Food Tray, boat, paper, 6 oz.			
25	20	Case/1,000	Kant Leak	Food Tray, boat, paper, 8 oz.			
26	50	Case/1,000	Kant Leak	Food Tray, boat, paper, 1 # (16 oz)			
27	10	Case/1,000	Kant Leak	Food Tray, boat, paper, 32 oz			
28	200	Case/1,000		Plastic Fork, 5" heavy, black	Sample required		

Item No.	Quantity	Unit	Stock No.	Description	Trade Name & Other Information	Unit Price	Total Price
29	200	Case/400	Foodhandler 104FHCT14C	Plastic Gloves, size medium, textra used for hot food	Sample required		
30	50	Case/400	Food Handler 104FHCT 16C	Plastic Gloves, size large, textra used for hot food	Sample required		
31	20	Case/1000	VPF-M2	Gloves, vinyl powder free exam, medium	Sample required		
32	10	Case/1000	VPF-L3	Gloves, vinyl powder free exam, large	Sample required		
33	5	Case/1000		Gloves, vinyl powder free exam, extra large	Sample required		
34	35	Case/~750		Lid, plastic, clear, microwaveable square or round bowl, 6 oz.	For Item No. 8 above		
35	10	Case/1,000	Solo DNR610	Lid, dome, plastic, clear, no hole TP10			
36	15	Case/1,000	Solo 610TS	Lid, plastic, clear with straw slot for 10 oz parfait cup			
37	90	Case/6,000	Georgia Pacific 32002	Napkins, Easy Nap			
38	50	Case/1,000	Durable QPL-25	Pan liner, paper, full size Quilon			
39	75	Case/50	Food Handler 22PL3418	Pan liner, ovenable, 34" x 18", high heat			
40	15	Case/500	Sweetheart	Plates, styrofoam, 3 compartment, 10"			
41	5	Case/1000		Plates, paper, 9"			
42	100	Case/500		Platter, 9" oval styrofoam, 6-7/8" x 9-3/4"			

Item No.	Quantity	Unit	Stock No.	Description	Trade Name & Other Information	Unit Price	Total Price
43	175	Case/1,000		Plastic Spoons, 5" heavy, black			
44	400	Case/1,000	Prime Sour75002492	Spork, white medium polypropylene, spork only	Sample required		
45	45	Case/1,000		Spork package, heavy plastic, contains one spork, one napkin & one straw	Sample required		
46	10	Case/1,200	Cell-O-Core UPTGW4300R	Straw, plastic, 10", giant, wrapped, red			
47	15	Case/500	Pactiv OTH10601SG	Tray, 6 compartment, white foam, 8.5" x 11.5"			
48	5	Case/1,500	Pactiv PCS4412Y	Tray, 4 3/16 square, pressed classic stoneware			

Authorized Signature

Name of Firm

Telephone Number

Street Address

Date

City

State

Zip

Email address